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Index of Records Responsive to Access Request 20.044* 

Item Page(s) Description of Records 
Access 

Granted?  
Exemptions 

Applied? 
Comments 

1 1-6 

Realty Services: i) Listing offering the 
property for sale: MLS Listing Image; Globe 
& Mail Advertising Image; Broker (Colliers) 
website featured property image; GeoHub 
story, Heritage block survey*  

Full N/A 
*Copyright Act R.S 1985, c. C-42 applies to 
the use and reproduction of this document. 

2 7-27 

Realty Services: ii) Request for Expression of 
Interest call documents: Non-disclosure 
agreement (Corporation & Individual), Terms 
of Reference 

Full N/A  

3 28-104  
Realty Services: Asbestos Reassessment 
reports: 70-74, 76, 80 & 86 Main St N;  

Partial 14(1)  
Signatures of identifiable individuals 
redacted.  

4 
105-
116  

Concept drawings Full N/A  

5 
117-
137 

Colliers Confidential Information 
Memorandum 

Full N/A  

6 
138-
1,068  

Environmental Surveys, Downtown 
Brampton Secondary Plan & Zoning Bylaw– 
Office Consolidations, Facility Condition 
Audits, Geotechnical Investigation, Phase 1 
& 2 ESAs, Pre-Demolition Surveys, 
Structural Condition report, Supplemental 
Soil & Groundwater Investigation 

Partial 14(1)  
Signatures of identifiable individuals 
redacted.  

7 
1,069 – 
1,071 

Building Records: Surveys* for 70-74, 76 & 
86 Main St N 

Full  N/A 
*Copyright Act R.S 1985, c. C-42 applies to 
the use and reproduction of this document. 

8 
1,072-
1,303 

Planning Records: Email correspondence; 
Heritage designation report; article from 
newspaper; Heritage Board minutes & 
agendas 

Partial 14(1) 
Names, emails, websites, employers, 
positions, phone numbers, signatures of 
identifiable individuals redacted. 
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     *  A copy of the following records relating to the listing or sale of the Heritage Theatre Block: i) the listing offering the  
        property for sale; ii) the Request for Expression of Interest call documents; iii) surveys; and, iv) records related to the  
        designation of the property as a heritage property. The search timeframe is January 1, 2018 to present. 
 


